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Hossain Muhammed Elias Shovon

From: Ziauddin Chowdhury
Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 5:40 PM
To: HasanMohammad Kamrul; Hossain Muhammed Elias Shovon
Subject: RE: [External Mail]Kind consent on incidental cost

Okay to go  
 

From: HasanMohammad Kamrul <kamrul@xiaomi.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 5:31 PM 
To: Ziauddin Chowdhury <ziauddin@xiaomi.com>; Hossain Muhammed Elias Shovon <eliasshovon@xiaomi.com> 
Subject: RE: [External Mail]Kind consent on incidental cost 
 
Dear Zia Bhai, 
Please find the below agreement scn print. 
For your reference signed agreement herewith attached. 
With best regards 
Hasan 
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From: Ziauddin Chowdhury <ziauddin@xiaomi.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 5:19 PM 
To: Hossain Muhammed Elias Shovon <eliasshovon@xiaomi.com> 
Cc: HasanMohammad Kamrul <kamrul@xiaomi.com> 
Subject: RE: [External Mail]Kind consent on incidental cost 
 
Hasan vai  
Kinldy confirm scope is within agreement ?  
 
if yes, I am fine @shovon, this is urgent for biz .   
 
Thanks 
 
Zia  
 

From: Hossain Muhammed Elias Shovon <eliasshovon@xiaomi.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 3:19 PM 
To: Ziauddin Chowdhury <ziauddin@xiaomi.com> 
Cc: HasanMohammad Kamrul <kamrul@xiaomi.com> 
Subject: RE: [External Mail]Kind consent on incidental cost 
 
Dear Zia bhai, 
 
As RHAL is working on our expat E-Visa issue hence they are asking for a incidental cost regarding 
to use this amount for security clearance for Mr. Song Guankai (Kyle). As per agreement we may 
arrange this hence, need your kind approval to proceed with the same. 
 
Required Incidental Amount by RHAL: BDT 23K 
Purpose: Security Clearance for Expat (E-Visa) 
 
Thanks in advance for your kind approval. 
 
Best Regards, 
SHOVON 
 
From: Md. Azizur Rahman Faruque <faruquerha@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 2:23 PM 
To: Hossain Muhammed Elias Shovon <eliasshovon@xiaomi.com> 
Cc: HasanMohammad Kamrul <kamrul@xiaomi.com>; Ziauddin Chowdhury <ziauddin@xiaomi.com>; Md. Mother 
Hossain Bhuiya <motaher.rha@gmail.com>; rahmanhasan98@gmail.com 
Subject: [External Mail]Kind consent on incidental cost 
 

[External Email] This message originated from outside of XIAOMI. Please treat this email with caution. If you have any questions 
about email security, please forward the email to misec@xiaomi.com for feedback. 

Dear Sir, 
Please be informed that security clearance of Mr. Kyle is in process. In this regard,an amount of BDT. 23,000 needed as an 
incidental cost for the jobs.  
Therefore we are seeking your kind approval for making the said payments.  
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Please give your consent by returning this email. 
 

Best Regards, 
 
Md. Azizur Rahman (Faruque) 
LL,M, CA (Partly Qualified) 
Managing Director 
Rahman Hossain Associates Ltd. 
Kabbocos Super Market 3-D plot (7th floor),  
Room- 8/11,8/12,8/13,8/14 
Kawran Bazar, C/A, Dhaka- 1215 
Tel       : +88-02-8129096 
           : +88-02-9142170 
Mobile  :+88-01755601834 
            :+88-01716209951 
E-mail   : faruquerha@gmail.com 
 


